BOARD OF PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID TABULATION

Sealed Bid # 58957-10M Description: Copper & Aluminum URD Jacketed Cable

Awarded 9-24-08

ITEM 1 ITEM 1 ITEM 1 ITEM 1 ITEM 2 ITEM 2 ITEM 2 ITEM 2
BIDDER Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time
Graybar 23,762.50/M 131,881.88 General 10-11 Weeks 6,209.38/M 83,267.79 General 10-11 Weeks
Fletcher- Reinhardt No Bid 5.49 73,620.90 Hendricks 5 Weeks ARO
Okonite 20.816 Okonite 10-12 Weeks 10.073 Okonite 10-12 Weeks
A & A Industrial 28.939 160,611.45 Superior 2-3 Weeks 7.051 94,553.91 Superior 2-3 Weeks
Anixter 26.90 149,295.00 Aetna 6-8 Weeks No Bid
ITEM 3 ITEM 3 ITEM 3 ITEM 3 ITEM 4 ITEM 4 ITEM 4 ITEM 4
BIDDER Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time
Graybar 23,762.50/M 340,754.25 General 10-11 Weeks 23,762.50/M 897,153.19 General 10-11 Weeks
Fletcher- Reinhardt No Bid No Bid
Okonite 20.816 Okonite 10-12 Weeks 20.816 Okonite 10-12 Weeks
A & A Industrial 28.939 414,985.26 Superior 2-3 Weeks 28.666 1,082,284.83 Superior 2-3 Weeks
Anixter 26.90 385,746.00 Aetna 6-8 Weeks 26.90 1,015,636.40 Aetna 6-8 Weeks
ITEM5 ITEM5 ITEM5 ITEM5 ITEM 6 ITEM 6 ITEM 6 ITEM 6
BIDDER Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time
Graybar 23,762.50/M 283,367.81 General 10-11 Weeks 6,209.38/M 84,478.61 General 10-11 Weeks
Fletcher- Reinhardt No Bid 5.49 74,691.45 Hendricks 5 Weeks ARO
Okonite 20.816 Okonite 10-12 Weeks 10.073 Okonite 10-12 Weeks
A & A Industrial 28.939 345,097.57 Superior 2-3 Weeks 7.051 95,928.85 Superior 2-3 Weeks
Anixter 26.90 320,782.50 Aetna 6-8 Weeks No Bid
TOTAL LOCAL
BIDDER BID PREFERENCE TERMS FOB FIRM BID
Graybar 1,820,903.53 No N30 SPFA No
Yes through 9717
Fletcher- Reinhardt 148,312.35 No N30 SP Except for Metals
Okonite 1,625,221.00 No 1/2-10 N30 Dest
A & A Industrial 2,193,461.87 Yes
Anixter 1,871,459.90 No N30 Dest No




Sealed Bid # 58957-10M
Awarded 9-24-08

BOARD OF PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID TABULATION

Description: Copper & Aluminum URD Jacketed Cable

ITEM 1 ITEM 1 ITEM 1 ITEM 1 ITEM 2 ITEM 2 ITEM 2 ITEM 2
ALTERNATIVE BID Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time
Graybar Alternate 23,762.50/M 131,881.88 Hendricks 10-11 Weeks 5,424.06/M 72,736.64 Hendricks 5 Weeks
ITEM 3 ITEM 3 ITEM 3 ITEM 3 ITEM 4 ITEM 4 ITEM 4 ITEM 4
Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time
Graybar Alternate 23,762.50/M 340,754.25 Hendricks 10-11 Weeks 23,762.50/M 897,153.19 Hendricks 10-11 Weeks
ITEM5 ITEM5 ITEM5 ITEM5 ITEM 6 ITEM 6 ITEM 6 ITEM 6
Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time
Graybar Alternate 23,762.50/M 283,367.81 Hendricks 10-11 Weeks 5,424.06/M 73,794.34 Hendricks 5 Weeks
TOTAL LOCAL
BID PREFERENCE TERMS FOB FIRM BID
Graybar Alternate 1,799,688.11 No N30 SPFA No




BOARD OF PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID TABULATION

Sealed Bid # 58957-10M Description: Copper & Aluminum URD Jacketed Cable

Awarded 9-24-08

ITEM 1 ITEM 1 ITEM 1 ITEM 1 ITEM 2 ITEM 2 ITEM 2 ITEM 2
ALTERNATIVE BID Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time
Stanion-No Metal Adjustable
Stanion-1/3 Neutral Compressed 21.23 117,826.50 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks No Bid
Stanion-1/3 Neutral Compact 20.99 116,494.50 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks 5.69 76,302.90 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks
Stanion-LC Shielded Compressed 18.20 101,010.00 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks No Bid
Stanion-LC Shielded Compact 17.91 99,400.50 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks 4.39 58,869.90 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks
Stanion-Full Neutral Compact No Bid 9.95 133,429.50 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks
ITEM 3 ITEM 3 ITEM 3 ITEM 3 ITEM 4 ITEM 4 ITEM 4 ITEM 4
Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time
Stanion-1/3 Neutral Compressed 21.23 304,438.20 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks 21.23 801,538.65 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks
Stanion-1/3 Neutral Compact 20.99 300,996.60 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks 20.29 792,477.45 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks
Stanion-LC Shielded Compressed 18.20 260,988.00 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks 18.20 687,141.00 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks
Stanion-LC Shielded Compact 17.91 256,829.40 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks 17.91 676,192.05 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks
ITEM5 ITEM5 ITEM5 ITEM5 ITEM 6 ITEM 6 ITEM 6 ITEM 6
Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time
Stanion-1/3 Neutral Compressed 21.23 253,167.75 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks No Bid
Stanion-1/3 Neutral Compact 20.99 250,305.75 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks 5.69 77,412.45 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks
Stanion-LC Shielded Compressed 18.20 217,035.00 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks No Bid
Stanion-LC Shielded Compact 17.91 213,576.75 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks 4.39 59,725.95 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks
Stanion-Full Neutral Compact No Bid 9.95 135,369.75 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks
TOTAL LOCAL
BID PREFERENCE TERMS FOB FIRM BID
Stanion-No Metal Adjustable
Stanion-1/3 Neutral Compressed 1,745,770.35 Yes N45 Dest Yes
Stanion-1/3 Neutral Compact 1,613,989.65 Yes N45 Dest Yes
Stanion-LC Shielded Compressed 1,533,043.00 Yes N45 Dest Yes
Stanion-LC Shielded Compact 1,364,594.50 Yes N45 Dest Yes
Stanion-Full Neutral Compact 1,745,770.35 Yes N45 Dest Yes




Sealed Bid # 58957-10M
Awarded 9-24-08

BOARD OF PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID TABULATION

Description: Copper & Aluminum URD Jacketed Cable

ITEM 1 ITEM 1 ITEM 1 ITEM 1 ITEM 2 ITEM 2 ITEM 2 ITEM 2
ALTERNATIVE BID Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time
Stanion-Metal Adjustable
Stanion-Full Neutral Prysmian 20.06 111,333.00 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks 9.41 126,188.00 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks
ITEM 3 ITEM 3 ITEM 3 ITEM 3 ITEM 4 ITEM 4 ITEM 4 ITEM 4
Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time
Stanion-Full Neutral Prysmian 20.06 287,660.40 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks 20.06 757,365.30 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks
ITEM5 ITEM5 ITEM5 ITEM5 ITEM 6 ITEM 6 ITEM 6 ITEM 6
Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time
Stanion-Full Neutral Prysmian 20.06 239,215.50 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks 9.41 128,023.05 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks
TOTAL LOCAL
BID PREFERENCE TERMS FOB FIRM BID
Stanion-Metal Adjustable 1,649,785.25 Yes N45 Dest Yes w/ Metal Adj.
ITEM 1 ITEM 1 ITEM 1 ITEM 1 ITEM 2 ITEM 2 ITEM 2 ITEM 2
ALTERNATIVE BID Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time
Stanion-1/3 Neutral w/Metal Adj
Stanion-1/3 Neutral 20.06 111,333.00 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks 5.44 72,950.40 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks
ITEM 3 ITEM 3 ITEM 3 ITEM 3 ITEM 4 ITEM 4 ITEM 4 ITEM 4
Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time
Stanion-1/3 Neutral 20.06 287,660.40 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks 20.06 757,365.30 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks
ITEM5 ITEM5 ITEM5 ITEM5 ITEM 6 ITEM 6 ITEM 6 ITEM 6
Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time
Stanion-1/3 Neutral 20.06 239,215.50 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks 5.44 74,011.20 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks
TOTAL LOCAL
BID PREFERENCE TERMS FOB FIRM BID
Stanion-1/3 Neutral w/Metal Adj 1,542,535.80 Yes N45 Dest Yes w/ Metal Adj.




Sealed Bid # 58957-10M
Awarded 9-24-08

BOARD OF PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID TABULATION

Description: Copper & Aluminum URD Jacketed Cable

ITEM 1 ITEM 1 ITEM 1 ITEM 1 ITEM 2 ITEM 2 ITEM 2 ITEM 2
ALTERNATIVE BID Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time
LC Shield/Metals Adjustable 18.54 102,897.00 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks 4.25 58,992.50 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks
Nexann 20.24 112,332.00 Nexann 6-8 Weeks 5.91 79,253.10 Nexann 6-8 Weeks
Southwire 24.479 135,858.45 Southwire 10-12 Weeks 5.32 71,341.20 Southwire 10-12 Weeks
ITEM 3 ITEM 3 ITEM 3 ITEM 3 ITEM 4 ITEM 4 ITEM 4 ITEM 4
Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time
LC Shield/Metals Adjustable 18.54 265,863.60 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks 18.54 699,977.70 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks
Nexann 20.24 290,241.60 Nexann 6-8 Weeks 20.24 764,161.20 Nexann 6-8 Weeks
Southwire 24.479 351,028.86 Southwire 10-12 Weeks 24.479 924,204.64 Southwire 10-12 Weeks
ITEM5 ITEM5 ITEM5 ITEM5 ITEM 6 ITEM 6 ITEM 6 ITEM 6
Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time Unit Price Total Manufacturer Delivery Time
LC Shield/Metals Adjustable 18.54 221,089.50 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks 4.25 57,821.25 Prysmian 6-8 Weeks
Nexann 20.24 241,362.00 Nexann 6-8 Weeks 5.91 80,405.55 Nexann 6-8 Weeks
Southwire 24.479 291,912.07 Southwire 10-12 Weeks 5.32 72,378.60 Southwire 10-12 Weeks
TOTAL LOCAL
BID PREFERENCE TERMS FOB FIRM BID
LC Shield/Metals Adjustable 1,404,641.55 Yes N45 Dest Yes w/ Metal Adj.
Nexann 1,567,755.45 Yes N30 Dest Yes w/ Metal Adj.
Southwire 1,846,723.82 Yes N30 Dest Yes w/ Metal Adj.




