Kansas City
Board of Public Utilities

Awarded 1-8-08
LOCATION: SERVICE CENTER

DESCRIPTION: 2008 ANNUAL SUPPLY OF TRANSFORMERS

BID TABULATION

SEALED BID: #58944-10M
DUE: November 7, 2007

ITEM NO. 1 ITEM NO. 2 ITEM NO 3
VENDOR NAME PTC 15KVA Stock #X0156120 PTC 25KVA Stock #X0256120 PTC 37.5KVA Stock #X0376120
QTY | NOLOAD LOAD [ UNITPRICE] TOTAL QTY [ NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL QTY] NOLOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE]  TOTAL
Cooper Power Systems 10 35 281|$  701.99 [ $ 7,019.90 55 54 376| $ 878.88 | $ 48,338.40 55 85 519|$ 1,111.41 [$ 61,127.55
Delta-Y Electric 10 $ - 55 $ - 55 $ -
HD Supply Utilities 10 43 221|$  829.79 | $ 8,297.90 55 49 451 $ 856.38 | $ 47,100.90 55 72 455/ $  1,160.64 | $ 63,835.20
Kuhlman Electric Corp. 10 $ - 55 $ - 55 $ -
PDS (ABB) 10 41 304|$  774.00 | $ 7,740.00 55 50 390| $ 992.00 | $ 54,560.00 55 73 557|$ 1,150.00 [ $ 63,250.00
Stanion Electric (KCK) Central Moloney 5 37 262|$ 1,051.11 [$ 5,255.55 25 53 356|$  1,267.78 [ $ 31,694.50 50 71 512|$ 1,496.67 | $ 74,833.50
Stanion Electric (KCK) Ermco 10 37 268|$ 1,186.67 | $ 11,866.70 55 62 346|$  1,385.56 [ $ 76,205.80 55 85 439/ $ 1,698.89 | $ 93,438.95
Stanion Electric (KCK) Howard 10 39 229|$  847.78 | $ 8,477.80 55 53 370|$ 103222 [$ 56,772.10 55 81 441 $  1,306.67 | $ 71,866.85
ITEM NO. 4 ITEM NO. 5 ITEM NO. 6
VENDOR NAME PTC 50 KVA Stock #X0506120 PTC 75 KVA Stock #X0756120 PTC 100KVA Stock #1006120
QTY | NOLOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE[  TOTAL QTY [ NOLOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL QTY ] NOLOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE[  TOTAL
Cooper Power Systems 55 116 601| $ 1,292.63 | $ 71,094.65 17 157 817|$  1,870.50 [ $ 31,798.50 9
Delta-Y Electric 55 $ - 17 $ - 9 $ -
HD Supply Utilities 55 91 609| $ 1,260.64 | $ 69,335.20 17 128 878|/$  1,776.60 [ $ 30,202.20 9 150 1005 $ 2,341.49 | $ 21,073.41
Kuhlman Electric Corp. 55 $ - 17 $ - 9 $ -
PDS (ABB) 55 91 578/ $ 1,383.00 | $ 76,065.00 17 122 783|$  1,878.00 [ $ 31,926.00 9 156 1163 $ 2,655.00 | $ 23,895.00
Stanion Electric (KCK) Central Moloney 50 101 564|$ 1,732.22 | $ 86,611.00 15 146 754|$ 223889 [ $ 33,583.35 9 137 1125| $ 2,897.78 | $ 26,080.02
Stanion Electric (KCK) Ermco 55 102 583| $ 1,871.11 | $102,911.05 17 138 843 2496.67| $ 42,443.39 9 165 1121 2934.44| $ 26,409.96
Stanion Electric (KCK) Howard 55 92 559| $ 1,602.22 | $ 88,122.10 17 120 750 2386.67| $ 40,573.39 9 142 1105 2927.78| $ 26,350.02
ITEM NO. 7 ITEM NO. 8 ITEM NO 9
VENDOR NAME PTC 167KVA Stock #X1676120 PTC 250KVA Stock #X2506120 PTC 25KVA Stock #X0256320
QTY | NOLOAD | LOAD [ UNITPRICE] TOTAL QTY | NOLOAD] LOAD | UNITPRICE | TOTAL QTY ][ NOLOAD ] LOAD | UNITPRICE] TOTAL




Kansas City
Board of Public Utilities

Awarded 1-8-08
LOCATION: SERVICE CENTER

DESCRIPTION: 2008 ANNUAL SUPPLY OF TRANSFORMERS

BID TABULATION

SEALED BID: #58944-10M
DUE: November 7, 2007

VENDOR NAME

PTC 100KVA Stock #X1006320

PTC 167KVA Stock #X1676320

PTC 250KVA Stock #X2506320

Cooper Power Systems 6 #VALUE! 12 #VALUE! 9 52 419 $ 875.06 7,875.54

Delta-Y Electric 6 $ - 1 $ - 9 -
HD Supply Utilities 6 227 1878 $ 3,215.96 | $ 19,295.76 1 332 2234 $ 6,757.45 | $ 6,757.45 9 52 369| $ 888.30 7,994.70

Kuhlman Electric Corp. 6 $ - 1 $ - 9 -
PDS (ABB) 6 233 1480 $ 3,846.00 [ $ 23,076.00 1 290 2483 $ 4,654.00 | $ 4,654.00 9 62 400 $ 927.00 8,343.00
Stanion Electric (KCK) Central Moloney 6 213 1768| $ 4,107.78 | $ 24,646.68 0 272 2653 $ 5,668.89 | $ = 6 54 365|$ 1,217.78 7,306.68
Stanion Electric (KCK) Ermco 6 242 1608/ $ 4,561.11 | $ 27,366.66 1 359 2235 $ 531333 |$ 5,313.33 9 59 365/ $ 1,318.89 11,870.01
Stanion Electric (KCK) Howard 6 253 1520| $ 4,337.78 | $ 26,026.68 1 332 2234| $ 6,633.33|$ 6,633.33 9 57 363| $ 1,113.33 10,019.97

ITEM NO. 10 ITEM NO. 11 ITEM NO. 12
VENDOR NAME PTC 37.5KVA Stock #0376320 PTC 50KVA Stock #X0506320 PTC 75KVA Stock #X0756320

QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE] TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Cooper Power Systems 21 73 434 $ 1,131.69 | $ 23,765.49 12 92 624 $ 1,277.34 | $ 15,328.08 6 131 827|$ 1,759.43 10,556.58

Delta-Y Electric 21 $ - 12 $ - 6 -
HD Supply Utilities 21 73 400( $ 1,176.60 | $ 24,708.60 12 77 657| $ 1,291.49 | $ 15,497.88 6 121 822|$ 1,777.66 10,665.96

Kuhlman Electric Corp. 21 $ - 12 $ - 6 -
PDS (ABB) 21 78 434 $ 1,220.00 | $ 25,620.00 12 95 519| $ 1,444.00 | $ 17,328.00 6 119 770l $ 1,783.00 10,698.00
Stanion Electric (KCK) Central Moloney 12 80 442|$ 1,47222 | $ 17,666.64 12 85 670| $ 1,671.11 | $ 20,053.32 6 126 839| $ 2,205.56 13,233.36
Stanion Electric (KCK) Ermco 21 74 484 $ 1,614.44 | $ 33,903.24 12 99 553| $ 1,843.33 | $ 22,119.96 6 135 794 $ 2,433.33 14,599.98
Stanion Electric (KCK) Howard 21 72 486| $ 1,336.67 | $ 28,070.07 12 92 543| $ 1,654.44 | $ 19,853.28 6 118 787|$ 2,491.11 14,946.66

$ - $ - -

ITEM NO. 13 ITEM NO. 14 ITEM NO. 15




Kansas City
Board of Public Utilities

Awarded 1-8-08

LOCATION: SERVICE CENTER BID TABULATION SEALED BID: #58944-10M
DESCRIPTION: 2008 ANNUAL SUPPLY OF TRANSFORMERS DUE: November 7, 2007
QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE] TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Cooper Power Systems 15 157 756/ $ 1,803.99 [ $ 27,059.85 15 $ - 9 $ -
Delta-Y Electric 15 $ - 15 $ - 9 $ -
HD Supply Utilities 15 131 1222 $ 2,347.87 | $ 35,218.05 15 206 1930 $ 3,195.74 | $ 47,936.10 9 321 1965/ $ 5,619.15|$ 50,572.35
Kuhlman Electric Corp. 15 $ - 15 $ - 9 $ -
PDS (ABB) 15 132 1174/ $ 2,554.00 [ $ 38,310.00 15 221 1276 $ 3,745.00 | $ 56,175.00 9 281 1940( $ 4,843.00 | $ 43,587.00
Stanion Electric (KCK) Central Moloney 12 148 1073| $ 2,735.56 | $ 32,826.72 12 216 1632| $ 3,916.67 | $ 47,000.04 6 295 2389|$ 5,323.33[$ 31,939.98
Stanion Electric (KCK) Ermco 15 157 1142 $ 2,853.33 | $ 42,799.95 15 214 1701 $ 4,301.11 | $ 64,516.65 9 328 2108/ $ 5,715.56 | $ 51,440.04
Stanion Electric (KCK) Howard 15 155 1055/ $ 2,714.44 | $ 40,716.60 15 228 1536 $ 3,835.56 | $ 57,533.40 9 321 1965/ $ 5,501.11 | $ 49,509.99
ITEM NO. 16 ITEM NO. 17 ITEM NO. 18
VENDOR NAME PTC 25KVA Stock #X0256220 PTC 37.5KVA Stock #X0376220 PTC 50KVA Stock #X0506220
QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE] TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Cooper Power Systems 3 58 408| $ 856.01 [ $ 2,568.03 6 89 474 $ 1,091.93 |$ 6,551.58 6 95 628|$ 1,27155|%$ 7,629.30
Delta-Y Electric 3 $ - 6 $ - 6 $ -
HD Supply Utilities 3 54 347( $ 964.89 | $ 2,894.67 6 66 466| $ 1,19468 | $ 7,168.08 6 89 556|$ 1,371.28 |$ 8,227.68
Kuhlman Electric Corp. 3 $ - 6 $ - 6 $ -
PDS (ABB) 3 57 313|$ 1,064.00|$ 3,192.00 6 79 558| $ 1,147.00 | $  6,882.00 6 82 708|$ 1,299.00 | $ 7,794.00
Stanion Electric (KCK) Central Moloney 3 62 343|$ 1,248.89 ($ 3,746.67 6 73 547 $ 1,440.00 [$  8,640.00 6 101 564| $ 1,680.00 | $ 10,080.00
Stanion Electric (KCK) Ermco 3 64 332|$ 1,437.78|$ 4,313.34 6 85 406| $ 1,810.00 | $ 10,860.00 6 97 519($ 2,002.22 |$ 12,013.32
Stanion Electric (KCK) Howard 3 60 350[$ 1,346.67 |$ 4,040.01 6 72 467| $ 146444 |$ 8,786.64 6 94 560[$ 1,751.11|$ 10,506.66
ITEM NO. 19 ITEM NO. 20 ITEM NO. 21
VENDOR NAME PTC 75KVA Stock #X0756220 PTC 100KVA Stock #X1006220 PTC 167KVA Stock #X1676220
QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE] TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Cooper Power Systems 3 157 756/ $ 1,803.99 [$ 5,411.97 3 $ - 3 $ -




Kansas City
Board of Public Utilities

Awarded 1-8-08
LOCATION: SERVICE CENTER

DESCRIPTION: 2008 ANNUAL SUPPLY OF TRANSFORMERS

BID TABULATION

SEALED BID: #58944-10M
DUE: November 7, 2007

Delta-Y Electric 3 $ - 3 $ - 3 -
HD Supply Utilities 3 122 700($ 1,860.64|$ 5,581.92 3 154 1041 $ 2,534.04 | $ 7,602.12 3 266 1458| $ 3,464.89 10,394.67
Kuhlman Electric Corp. 3 $ - 3 $ - 3 -
PDS (ABB) 3 122 749 $ 1,799.00 | $ 5,397.00 3 139 1199 $ 2,449.00 | $  7,347.00 3 198 1422|$ 4,006.00 12,018.00
Stanion Electric (KCK) Central Moloney 3 121 778/ $ 2,283.33 [$ 6,849.99 3 156 1048| $ 2,781.11 [$ 8,343.33 3 213 1755 $ 4,031.11 12,093.33
Stanion Electric (KCK) Ermco 3 128 802| $ 2,748.89|$ 8,246.67 3 161 847| $ 3,441.11 | $ 10,323.33 3 243 1262| $ 4,687.78 14,063.34
Stanion Electric (KCK) Howard 3 119 764 $ 2,847.78 | $ 8,543.34 3 140 1087| $ 3,331.11 | $ 9,993.33 3 250 1368| $  4,941.11 14,823.33
ITEM NO. 22 ITEM NO. 23 ITEM NO. 24
VENDOR NAME PTC 250KVA Stock #X2506220 TOTAL FOR POLE TOP CONVENTIONALS PM 25KVA Stock #X0256130

QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE] TOTAL TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Cooper Power Systems 1 $ - #VALUE! 22 55 360 $ 1,054.44 23,197.68
Delta-Y Electric 1 $ - $ - 22 -
HD Supply Utilities 1 301 1909( $ 7,013.83|($ 7,013.83 $ 507,374.63 22 50 387| $ 1,995.74 43,906.28
Kuhlman Electric Corp. 1 $ - $ - 22 -
PDS (ABB) 1 268 2566 $ 4,241.00 [$ 4,241.00 $ 532,098.00 22 -
Stanion Electric (KCK) Central Moloney 0 333 1853| $ 5,875.56 | $ - $ 502,484.66 10 53 391|$ 1,947.78 19,477.80
Stanion Electric (KCK) Ermco 1 352 1745/ $ 6,018.89 [ $ 6,018.89 $  693,044.56 22 50 403[ $ 2,082.22 45,808.84
Stanion Electric (KCK) Howard 1 301 1909/ $ 6,878.89|$ 6,878.89 $  609,044.44 22 56 372| $  2,060.00 45,320.00

ITEM NO. 25 ITEM NO. 26 ITEM NO. 27
VENDOR NAME PM 37.5KVA Stock #X0376130 PM 50KVA Stock #X0506130 PM 75KVA Stock #X0756130

QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE] TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Cooper Power Systems 35 77 514 $ 2,110.56 | $ 73,869.60 28 92 623| $ 2,328.50 | $ 65,198.00 28 123 884| $ 2,606.96 72,994.88
Delta-Y Electric 35 $ - 28 $ - 28 -




Kansas City
Board of Public Utilities

Awarded 1-8-08
LOCATION: SERVICE CENTER

DESCRIPTION: 2008 ANNUAL SUPPLY OF TRANSFORMERS

BID TABULATION

SEALED BID: #58944-10M
DUE: November 7, 2007

HD Supply Utilities 35 66 483 $ 2,262.77 | $ 79,196.95 28 83 650| $ 2,336.17 | $ 65,412.76 28 99 946| $ 2,785.11 77,983.08
Kuhlman Electric Corp. 35 $ - 28 $ - 28 -
PDS (ABB) 35 $ - 28 $ - 28 -
Stanion Electric (KCK) Central Moloney 40 67 567| $ 2,198.89 | $ 87,955.60 40 93 623| $ 2,444.44 | $ 97,777.60 30 114 846| $ 3,046.67 91,400.10
Stanion Electric (KCK) Ermco 35 77 424 $  2,494.44 | $ 87,305.40 28 98 637| $ 2,491.11 | $ 69,751.08 28 127 890| $ 3,021.11 84,591.08
Stanion Electric (KCK) Howard 35 72 484 $ 2,360.00 | $ 82,600.00 28 81 680| $ 2,447.78 | $ 68,537.84 28 112 806| $  3,140.00 87,920.00
ITEM NO. 28 ITEM NO. 29 ITEM NO. 30
VENDOR NAME PM 100KVA Stock #X1006130 PM 167KVA Stock #X1676130 PM 250KVA Stock #X2506130

QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE] TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Cooper Power Systems 22 166 1004| $ 3,036.14 | $ 66,795.08 2 230 1675 $ 3,849.20 | $  7,698.40 4 371 2557| $ 13,938.40 55,753.60
Delta-Y Electric 22 $ - 2 $ - 4 -
HD Supply Utilities 22 151 1046| $ 3,110.64 | $ 68,434.08 2 240 1431 $ 4,654.26 | $  9,308.52 4 304 1961| $ 8,681.91 34,727.64
Kuhlman Electric Corp. 22 $ - 2 $ - 4 -
PDS (ABB) 22 $ - 2 $ - 4 -
Stanion Electric (KCK) Central Moloney 10 150 960| $ 3,608.89 [ $ 36,088.90 2 213 1691| $ 4,620.00 | $  9,240.00 2 838 2003 $ 7,731.11 15,462.22
Stanion Electric (KCK) Ermco 22 144 980( $ 3,982.22 | $ 87,608.84 2 316 1155 $ 6,320.00 | $ 12,640.00 4 350 2057| $ 6,843.33 27,373.32
Stanion Electric (KCK) Howard 22 153 967[ $ 3,666.67 | $ 80,666.74 2 239 1496 $ 6,133.33 | $ 12,266.66 4 304 1961| $  8,498.89 33,995.56

ITEM NO. 31 ITEM NO. 32 ITEM NO. 33
VENDOR NAME PM 75KVA Stock #X0756639 PM 112.5KVA Stock #X1126639 PM 150KVA Stock #1506639

QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE] TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Cooper Power Systems 5 159 929($ 9,193.54 | $ 45,967.70 5 211 1264| $ 9,712.44 | $ 48,562.20 6 251 1650| $ 10,236.60 61,419.60
Delta-Y Electric 5 $ - 5 $ - 6 -
HD Supply Utilities 5 185 1208| $ 8,251.06 | $ 41,255.30 5 244 1611| $ 9,074.47 | $ 4537235 6 247 1806| $ 9,419.15 56,514.90




Kansas City
Board of Public Utilities

Awarded 1-8-08
LOCATION: SERVICE CENTER

DESCRIPTION: 2008 ANNUAL SUPPLY OF TRANSFORMERS

BID TABULATION

SEALED BID: #58944-10M
DUE: November 7, 2007

Kuhlman Electric Corp. 5 $ - 5 $ - 6 -
PDS (ABB) 5 $ - 5 $ - 6 -
Stanion Electric (KCK) Central Moloney 10 159 1134| $ 8,068.09 | $ 80,680.90 B 212 1792| $ 8,371.28 | $ 41,856.40 6 243 2005| $ 10,029.79 60,178.74
Stanion Electric (KCK) Ermco 5 165 927|$ 9,373.40 [ $ 46,867.00 5 229 1270[ $ 10,150.00 | $ 50,750.00 6 250 1878/ $ 10,598.94 63,593.64
Stanion Electric (KCK) Howard 5 145 1047| $ 8,063.33 | $ 40,316.65 5 197 1335| $ 8,764.44 | $ 43,822.20 6 247 1806| $ 8,778.72 52,672.32
ITEM NO. 34 ITEM NO. 35 ITEM NO. 36
VENDOR NAME PM 225KVA Stock #X2256639 PM 300KVA Stock #X3006639 PM 5000KVA Stock #5006639

QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE] TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Cooper Power Systems 2 354 2302| $ 12,199.63 | $ 24,399.26 3 412 3243| $ 13,420.33 | $ 40,260.99 1 718 4416| $ 16,749.30 16,749.30
Delta-Y Electric 2 $ - 3 $ - 1 -
HD Supply Utilities 2 382 2416| $ 12,275.53 | $ 24,551.06 3 398 3057| $ 13,441.49 | $ 40,324.47 1 693 5385| $ 15,679.79 15,679.79
KuhIiman Electric Corp. 2 $ - 3 $ - 1 -
PDS (ABB) 2 $ - 3 $ - 1 -
Stanion Electric (KCK) Central Moloney 6 329 2892| $ 10,957.45 | $ 65,744.70 3 408 3530] $ 12,592.55 [ $ 37,777.65 1 571 4492 $ 18,780.85 18,780.85
Stanion Electric (KCK) Ermco 2 304 2560| $ 12,894.68 | $ 25,789.36 3 439 2978| $ 14,398.94 | $ 43,196.82 1 584 4332| $ 19,445.74 19,445.74
Stanion Electric (KCK) Howard 2 339 2370/ $ 11,453.19 | $ 22,906.38 3 398 3057| $ 12,862.77 | $ 38,588.31 1 603 4437( $ 16,794.68 16,794.68

ITEM NO. 37 ITEM NO. 38 ITEM NO. 39
VENDOR NAME PM 750KVA Stock #X7506639 PM 1000KVA Stock #X9006639 PM 1500KVA Stock #9506639

QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE] TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Cooper Power Systems 2 921 6100| $ 22,304.70 | $ 44,609.40 1 1102 8542| $ 27,911.00 | $ 27,911.00 1 1738 12971 $ 38,139.24 38,139.24
Delta-Y Electric 2 $ - 1 $ - 1 -
HD Supply Utilities 2 919 8255| $ 20,473.40 | $ 40,946.80 1 1235 10343| $ 23,927.66 | $ 23,927.66 1 1327 14898( $ 35,784.04 35,784.04
Kuhlman Electric Corp. 2 $ - 1 $ - 1 -




Kansas City
Board of Public Utilities

Awarded 1-8-08
LOCATION: SERVICE CENTER

DESCRIPTION: 2008 ANNUAL SUPPLY OF TRANSFORMERS

BID TABULATION

SEALED BID: #58944-10M
DUE: November 7, 2007

PDS (ABB) 2 $ - 1 $ - 1 -
Stanion Electric (KCK) Central Moloney 2 1194 7067| $ 22,096.81 [ $ 44,193.62 0|No Bid $ - 0|No Bid -
Stanion Electric (KCK) Ermco 2 938 6926| $ 22,034.04 | $ 44,068.08 1 1151 9439| $ 25,534.04 | $ 25,534.04 1 1632 12668| $ 41,104.26 41,104.26
Stanion Electric (KCK) Howard 2 914 6525| $ 20,792.22 | $ 41,584.44 1 1149 9153| $ 22,892.55 | $ 22,892.55 1 1327 14898| $ 34,342.55 34,342.55
ITEM NO. 40 ITEM NO. 41 ITEM NO. 42
VENDOR NAME PM 75KVA Stock #X0756339 PM 112.5KVA Stock #X1126339 PM 150KVA Stock #1506339

QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE] TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Cooper Power Systems 5 168 911| $ 9,117.15 | $ 45,585.75 5 213 1196 $ 9,636.05 | $ 48,180.25 5 255 1488| $ 10,255.04 51,275.20
Delta-Y Electric 5 $ - 5 $ - 5 -
HD Supply Utilities 5 216 993|$ 7,957.45($ 39,787.25 5 287 1340( $ 9,062.77 | $ 45,313.85 5 331 1740[ $ 9,509.57 47,547.85
Kuhlman Electric Corp. 5 $ - 5 $ - 5 -
PDS (ABB) 5 $ - 5 $ - 5 -
Stanion Electric (KCK) Central Moloney 3|No Bid $ - 5|No Bid $ - 5|No Bid -
Stanion Electric (KCK) Ermco 5 163 878/ $ 9,408.51 [ $ 47,042.55 5 223 1294| $ 9,876.60 | $ 49,383.00 5 272 1563 $ 10,538.30 52,691.50
Stanion Electric (KCK) Howard 5 146 954[ $ 7,845.56 | $ 39,227.80 5 202 1275| $ 8,898.89 | $ 44,494.45 5 248 1686| $  8,988.30 44,941.50

ITEM NO. 43 ITEM NO. 44 ITEM NO. 45
VENDOR NAME PM 225KVA Stock #X2256339 PM 300KVA Stock #X3006339 PM 500KVA Stock #5006339

QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE] TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Cooper Power Systems 3 358 2133| $ 12,336.19 | $ 37,008.57 3 427 2694| $ 13,821.66 | $ 41,464.98 6 649 4362| $ 16,293.73 97,762.38
Delta-Y Electric 3 $ - 3 $ - 6 -
HD Supply Utilities 3 412 2202| $ 11,488.30 | $ 34,464.90 3 397 2829| $ 12,946.81 | $ 38,840.43 6 751 4548| $ 15,455.32 92,731.92
KuhIiman Electric Corp. 3 $ - 3 $ - 6 -
PDS (ABB) 3 $ - 3 $ - 6 -




Kansas City
Board of Public Utilities

Awarded 1-8-08
LOCATION: SERVICE CENTER

DESCRIPTION: 2008 ANNUAL SUPPLY OF TRANSFORMERS

BID TABULATION

SEALED BID: #58944-10M
DUE: November 7, 2007

Stanion Electric (KCK) Central Moloney 4 364 2581| $ 11,024.47 | $ 44,097.88 5 396 3436| $ 12,877.66 | $ 64,388.30 B 629 4345/ $ 16,668.09 | $ 83,340.45
Stanion Electric (KCK) Ermco 3 337 2201| $ 12,565.96 | $ 37,697.88 3 436 2614| $ 15,108.51 | $ 45,325.53 6 629 4020( $ 17,664.89 | $ 105,989.34
Stanion Electric (KCK) Howard 3 338 2082| $ 11,378.89 | $ 34,136.67 3 397 2829 $ 12,389.36 | $ 37,168.08 6 606 3786| $ 16,498.89 [ $ 98,993.34
ITEM NO. 46 ITEM NO. 47 ITEM NO. 48
VENDOR NAME PM 750KVA Stock #X7506339 PM 1000KVA Stock #X9006339 PM 1500KVA Stock #9506339

QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE] TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Cooper Power Systems 5 935 5189| $ 21,674.99 | $108,374.95 3 1113 7032| $ 25,082.75 | $ 75,248.25 1 1597 9931| $ 34,776.52 [ $ 34,776.52
Delta-Y Electric 5 $ - 3 $ - 1 $ -
HD Supply Utilities 5 1088 6280| $ 19,501.06 | $ 97,505.30 3 1229 9031 $ 22,720.21 | $ 68,160.63 1 1481 10857| $ 31,546.81 [ $ 31,546.81
Kuhlman Electric Corp. 5 $ - 3 $ - 1 $ -
PDS (ABB) 5 $ - 3 $ - 1 $ -
Stanion Electric (KCK) Central Moloney B 935 7417| $ 23,045.74 | $ 69,137.22 2 1252 8698| $ 24,622.34 [ $ 49,244.68 1 2333 9607| $ 34,374.47 | $ 34,374.47
Stanion Electric (KCK) Ermco 5 941 5564| $ 21,609.57 | $108,047.85 3 1142 7827| $ 24,769.15 | $ 74,307.45 1 1541 9859| $ 32,612.77 [$ 32,612.77
Stanion Electric (KCK) Howard 5 863 5946| $ 19,758.89 | $ 98,794.45 3 1087 7404| $ 22,597.87 | $ 67,793.61 1 1481 10857| $ 30,275.53 | $ 30,275.53

ITEM NO. 49 ITEM NO. 50 ITEM NO. 51
VENDOR NAME PM 2000KVA Stock #X9996339 PM 2500KVA Stock #X9256339 PM 3000KVA Stock #9306339

QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE] TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL QTY NO LOAD LOAD UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Cooper Power Systems 3 1996 12645 $ 43,892.61 | $131,677.83 1 2318 17717| $ 49,653.45 | $ 49,653.45 1 2820 21202| $ 64,178.62 | $ 64,178.62
Delta-Y Electric 3 $ - 1 $ - 1 $ -
HD Supply Utilities 3 1904 14589( $ 34,911.70 | $104,735.10 1 1958 18114 $ 44,877.66 | $ 44,877.66 1 3128 22833 $ 59,910.64 | $ 59,910.64
Kuhlman Electric Corp. 3 $ - 1 $ - 1 $ -
PDS (ABB) 3 $ - 1 $ - 1 $ -
Stanion Electric (KCK) Central Moloney 0[No Bid $ - 1|No Bid $ - 1|No Bid $ -
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Awarded 1-8-08
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Kansas City
Board of Public Utilities

BID TABULATION

SEALED BID:

DUE: November 7, 2007

#58944-10M

Stanion Electric (KCK) Ermco 3 1784 14700 $ 41,465.96 | $124,397.88 1 2476 13196( $ 51,900.00 | $ 51,900.00 1|No Bid $
Stanion Electric (KCK) Howard 3 1904 14589| $ 33,602.13 | $100,806.39 1 1958 18114 $ 43,048.94 | $ 43,048.94 1 2422 21792| $ 60,215.96 | $ 60,215.96
ITEM NO. 52 ITEM NO. 53 ITEM NO. 55
VENDOR NAME PM 3750KVA Stock #X9376339 TOTAL FOR PADMOUNT GRAND TOTAL
TOTAL TOTAL
Cooper Power Systems $ 1,498,712.68 #VALUE!
Delta-Y Electric $ $
HD Supply Utilities $ 1,408,748.02 $ 1,916,122.65
Kuhlman Electric Corp. $ $

PDS (ABB) $ $  532,098.00

Stanion Electric (KCK) Centra | Moloney $ 1,051,198.08 $ 1,553,682.74

Stanion Electric (KCK) Ermco $ 1,504,823.25 $ 2,197,867.81

Stanion Electric (KCK) Howard $ 1,425,123.60 $ 2,034,168.04
VENDOR NAME DELIVERY TERMS FOB FIRM PRICE MFG.

Cooper Power Systems

Delta-Y Electric

HD Supply Utilities 9-31 Weeks |[Net 30 Des 3/31/2008 GE & Howard

Kuhlman Electric Corp.

PDS (ABB)

Stanion Electric (KCK) Central | Moloney 9-13 Weeks [Net 45 Des 12/31/08* *|f awarded all

Stanion Electric (KCK) Ermco Net 45 Des

Stanion Electric (KCK) Howard 12-26 Weeks[Net 45 Des 3/31/2008|Howard




